
WAIVER AND AGREEMENT NOT TO SUE FOR UNDERAGE CHILD

In consideration of The Green Valley Rifle & Pistol Club, Inc., A Missouri corporation permitting 
me to participate in and observe events and activities at its facilities, I, on my own behalf and on 
behalf of my heirs, representatives, and administrators and assigns, hereby WAIVE and 
FORGIVE any and all claims, demands causes of action, suits and rights I may have against 
that corporation for any personal injury (including death), loss and damage to property which I 
may have against that corporation that arise out of my Child’s participation in or observation of 
any event at the corporation’s facilities.

Further, I agree that I WILL NOT, nor will anyone acting on my behalf claiming by or through 
me, BRING OR MAINTAIN ANY SUIT IN COURT to assert any claim against that corporation 
that I may have arising out of the events and activities described and referred to in the 
preceding paragraph.  The purpose and intent of this paragraph is to preclude me from 
obtaining any money judgement against the Green Valley Rifle & Pistol Club, Inc., its Board of 
Directors and Officers.

I am over the age of 18 years and the parent or legal guardian of the child named below.

I recognize that The Corporation is not obligated to permit me to participate in or observe any of 
its activities and that it may require me to leave its property at any time.

I agree to assume all responsibility and liability for any act or acts of negligence, reckless, or 
criminal act or omission to act of my Guest or Guests at Green Valley Rifle & Pistol Ranges. (I 
understand that my Guest(s) includes any and all persons who enter on the range, use the 
range facilities or engage in or observe shooting and other activities at the range as a result of 
my invitation, permission or consent).

This instrument shall remain in full force and effect until it is revoked by me in writing and 
delivered personally to an officer of The Corporation.

HOWEVER, NOTHING IN THIS INSTRUMENT SHALL PRECLUDE ME FROM PROCEEDING 
AGAINST ANY PERSON, FIRM OR CORPORATION OTHER THAN GREEN VALLEY RIFLE &
PISTOL CLUB, INC.  FOR ANY CLAIMS, DEMANDS, CAUSES OF ACTION, SUITS AND 
RIGHTS THAT I MAY HAVE AGAINST SUCH OTHER PERSONS, FIRMS OR 
CORPORATIONS.  The intent of this paragraph is to allow me to obtain a money judgement 
against any person or entity other than The Corporation.

Participation in Discipline Events:  Green Valley Rifle & Pistol Club, Inc, its Board of Directors, 
Officers or pistol discipline volunteers can nor will be held liable for any competitor’s possible or 
perceived exposure to any virus while voluntarily choosing to compete in a match known to be 
occupied by other members of the general public.

Print the Name of the Child:  __________________________________

Signature of Parent or Legal Guardian:  _________________________  Date:  _____________

Print Name of Parent or Legal Guardian:  ___________________________________

Witness:  _________________________________
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